
Dream link –  
Independent Business Associate (IBA)/ Multi-Tier Affiliate marketer Agreement    
 
1. Dream link Multithread Private Limited (herein after referred as the 
“Company”) reserves all rights, whether to accept the application of applying to 
become an Independent Business Associate (IBA)/ Multi-Tier Affiliate marketer 
(herein after referred as the “Associate”) or reject whatsoever and it is final and 
binding on the applicant. On selection as Associate a unique identification number 
will be issued.  He / She from then forth is eligible for certain incentives like 
discounts, bonuses, Rewards or any other income as detailed in the business 
Opportunity of the Company.   
 
2.  It is also informed to everyone that our company does not charge any kind of 
registration amount or joining fees for becoming an independent business 
associate /customer of the company.  
 
3.   An individual can have three Associate ID on his/her name with the Company 
with one Pan Card. 
 
4. The Associate is a non-exclusive contractual. The associate is not an agent, 
employee or legal representative of the Company for any purpose whatsoever. He 
/ She shall be responsible for his/her own business and compliance of the central, 
state and local regulations and all applicable laws.   
 
5.     The associate shall abide by sales policy, Rules, Procedures, Terms and 
Conditions of the Company in vogue or as amended anytime in the future.   
 
6.     There is no any kind of Salary / Fixed Income / Commission / Bonuses / 
Incentives / Rewards etc. All are based on the sale volume generated by the 
associate himself/herself as well by his/her team and are calculated as per 
Compensation pay plan of the Company. Company reserves the right to change 
Business Volume/ Dream Points/ Dream Sales Incentives (BV/DP/DSI), other 
components of pay plan and method of Pay Plan at any point of time without 
prior notice.   
 



7.     Without prior approval from the Company, associate shall refrain from:  a)     
Promoting Company’s products/activities through any form of advertisement. b)     
Recruiting new associate through any type of media.   
8.     Company shall no way be responsible for any past, present or future liability 
incurred by the associate while conducting business with the Company.   
 
9.     Associates don't have to do any direct sales, they will only promote to get 
affiliate earnings as per company offer. The responsibility of supply will be of the 
company/vendor/franchise.    
 
10.  Goods and Services Tax (GST) on the income of the associate (if applicable) 
will be duly paid by the associate to the Government on due basic as per 
applicable norms.   
 
11. Any other taxes, levies on and above the income of the Associate earned from 
the Company will be borne and duly paid by the Associate to the concern 
authorities as per applicable norms.   
 
12. Associate shall promote Company’s products in accordance with the contents 
of Company’s printed document & support material supplied by the Company and 
prohibited to make any amendments thereto or revision thereof by the Associate.    
13. Associate shall not sale Company’s products to or through retail outlets/shops 
as it is contrary to the Sales Policy of the Company. Associate only can sale 
products thorough company franchise stores/ Company E-commerce platform 
after getting franchisee/e-commerce vendor Authorization/license from 
company.   
 
14. Associate will seek prior permission of the Company before selling or 
supplying products to or through E-Comm. Companies and Online Marketplace.   
 
15. TDS will be deducted as per the prevailing rules and regulations formulated by 
the Government.  
 
16.  Company is having the absolute rights to terminate the Associate I’d, in the 
event of failure on part of the Associate, to comply with the terms and conditions 
and code of ethics. Prior notice will be served in such cases. Without notice also 
can deactivate the user rights in case found violating code of conduct.  



 
17.  Surrender of Account: In case Associate wants to surrender their account, 
need to submit written request and account will be terminated and all rights will 
be ceased. If respective accounts holder/IBA wants to re-sign up, only can apply 
after 180 days from date of submission of previous surrender.  
 
18.  We promote our products by encouraging people to talk about them, 
showcasing them in stores or through demonstrations, distributing pamphlets 
and brochures, utilizing E-Commerce, digital marketing, and online promotions. 
Importantly, we do not engage in financial investments or operate investment 
schemes or chit fund entrepreneurship.  
 
19.    It is hereby also informed to the general public that our company does not 
take responsibility for any kind of false commitment / promises / representation 
etc. made by any Associate/ customer/ franchisee / Online vendor on behalf of 
the company. This information is provided by Dream link Multithread Pvt. Ltd... 
We make no representation or warranties of any kind express or implied about 
the completeness, accuracy, or availability with respect to the website or the 
information, products.  
 
20.  Our company in no event will liable for any loss or damage including without 
limitations, indirect or consequential loss or damage, or any loss or damage 
whatsoever arising from loss of data or profit arises out of or in connection with 
the use of this website. Although, through this website you are able to link to 
other website which are not under the control of DREAMLINK MULTITRADE PVT. 
LTD. & we have no control over the nature. Content and availability of those sites. 
 
Every effort is made and shall be made in future to keep the website up and 
running smoothly. However, our company does not take any responsibility and 
shall not be liable for the eventuality, in case the website being temporarily 
unavailable due to technical issues beyond our control etc.   
 
 
 I agreed and confirms that - I have read, understood and agreed to the above 
rules, terms and conditions. 


